Bid #: _26-026

Project: _Rock & Sand

Date: 04/01/2026 Time: 2:00 P.M. CDT

Department: _ Streets

Bidder Name

Magnader
5

€.

New Frenten

Materiala

Kimaterials

Addendum #1

(1N

(2)

(?)

Bidder #
I e 5.95 L 20 no bid
2. |Comi 2 Clean 9.50 Fi. 30
3. |Coml 4 Clean no bid No bid
4. |Coml 1" Clean //.00 A T
5. |Coml 1% Clean no bid No bid
6. |Coml Gabion (Small) Nno bid /£.25
7. |coml Quarry Run LS F.5D
sone " | no bid | 20.00

Coml 5/16M, 7/16M,
fine lime

no bid

2. FS

10.

Manufactured Sand

Nno bid

No bid

11.

MoDOT Type 1

. 7S

7.50

12.

MoDOT Type 5

o T

7.5D

13.

MoDOT Select
Backfill

Ne bid

No bld

14.

MoDOT Rock Fill
Base (6M)

No bid

No bid

15.

MoDOT Concrete
Stone (Grade D)

No bid

/N0 bid

initial ( @
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BIDDER #

(1)

€2)

(3)

(Continued)

16. gtzlr?g;rG(r::ggrs;e No bid No bid No pid
17. gglr?&{gzgz 2) [9.00 20.00

18 |Revetmentstone | NO DI 20.00

|

Ny bid

19. [MSD 1
20. |MSD 2 \

21. |MsD 3 \

22 |MSD 4 (2m)

23. |MSD 5 (revet)

24, |MSD 6 (gabion)

25 |MSD 7 (revet)

26. [MSD 8 (revet) L4

27, [A9me lo. DS

28. |AG Stone NN pbid A

29. |Coml Screenings .50 R 35

o | Linssist®, No bid Nno bid

o1 [sione 5.95 (.20

. [sone (.25 (o4O

33, Sone T Noe bid .50

34.|comL  conc stone| 10 Hidk D.50 L

initim&
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BIDDER #
(Continued)

(1)

(£2)

(2)

COML 1 %" Conc

No bid

No bid

no biad

35. |Stone
36. gtoonlvleL 2 Clean [06.30
N gtoorr\(uel_ 4" Clean no bid
38. ggr?cosTtﬁ;ade ° |
MoDOT Grade E /
39. |Conc Stone
40. (Mine Run l L
41, I\SA:rEiOT conerete \I/ [BFS
42 |1"x 1% Landscape ’5.50 18505
4. |Lancacape 3550 /(.00
44 |9 x 318" 5550 Nb 2y
45. |Gabion (3" x 8) No bi d
46. |Gabion (small)
47. |Gabion (large)
48. |Boulders / Rip Rap \V
49. |Class 2-C Ballast l 25850
50. [Class 1-D Ballast [ 5)? KO
51. |Area #3 Rail Ballast ’ 58 50
52. |Utility Stone .00
55, |(LD) Cone Stone v 38.50 N

initial@
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(Continued) (1) (2) (3)

54, % x W No bid S50 No bid
55. |3/8" x 3%.50

56. |3/8" x #4 38.50

57. | x 18" 38.50

58. |Grit 3&. .50

59. |11/2° Minus No bid

60. |%’ Minus H5.00

61. |5 Minus D5.00

62. [3116" x0 No bid

63. |Mfg Sand 0’25 AGNY % 4

64. |Ilce Control Sand ésgb 15 '75-

5. [Eand D5.00 N bid
- E;Zr)nix Floor (80# ﬂb bJ Co I

Premix Floor (3000#
67. |bag) \

Dried Std IMRR
68. |Products (50# bag)

Products (3000#

Dried Std IMTR
69. |bag)

J
70. |O'Fallon Type 5 Rock \/ \‘/ \/
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BIDDER #
ontinued

71. |Small Load Fee

(2)

OQSOG min,

A7.60

ND bids

72. |Weigh-In Fee

no bid

Nno bid

N bids

Prepared by{
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