Bid #: 26-008

Project:

2026 Fertilizer & Pesticides

Department:

Parks & Recreation

Date: 01/22/2026 Time: 2:30 P.M. CST
Site One f\/a rocll s é\ R . Rduance HCJ ena
Bidder Name 0 F l
}\&gﬁ%c;?ﬁe Robin3on ’Ttgc;lmﬁmb Onemn B,
Bidder # (l ) CC>Q'> C 5.) C‘—F) 65 3
20-0-20 Fertilizer w/
1 ?O%S\éVLIJN orPncw:cL)Jr)e 50 Ib bag .9241" ,:Z' OZBOQ P e bjd adlo; (s ](_95-0
2 |so% sowrsesse . 0002 | L2E&F 2'7.00 No bid | 228.00 2235
3 [t Jeowesg | 30,17 I AN W ) s D100
Daconil
4 gglg:rl;Chlorothalonil 25galjug| 2S00 /50.F§ NO bi A O3S Qa s
Halosulfuron
5 ::éigggehammerlP ;ﬁ:z L 55 L 1 PR 5. 00 50.00 B4, 10 245, 00
6 gﬁi%gﬁmenmmlsau 25galjug| [BBRRA o 0806 .05 O b;d 1 e 5 [ F5.00
7 [pigare v 10 oo el 20/ By 5000 | nobid | 32.85 No bid
8 |Glyphosate 41% 2.5 gal SS;.C)? -LJ?C() CQO,OO 5‘560 #835—
o g% T bote /8.9 205.00 no bid ~009.00 05,59
10 ;:E?gyigtr?rligaj iy e R {5605 No bid 65,00 5394
11.8%
11 |oropiconazole 14.3% | S(0.80 260.00 NS bid "7.00 Gl 1§
12 |aluminum sulfate |50 Ib bag N bid NO fale, N0.00 No bl d No bid
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Bidder Name 51:;0&1%;% Hannells &Rigin Son Hi‘-*:’%liinﬁ Half\_gq "é:t-al

Bidder # C1) () (3) /) (5)

13 [Cutrine Plus iquid ! 92! L FE Q5.00 no bid JOQ.DQ ot/ |.00

L 20z /4. FF 50.00 /700 22,30 1551

15 oack o dye . [sote /56.4F | nobid | no bid 7745 1ieRa.

16 |Cutrine plus granular [30bbag | GG F) £5.00 No bid [5G 10 55.50

7 |2 Aimdases sowees | 2307 | 2250 | o bid /§.05 /9. 40

16 5020 1% Ronster [s0bbag | Lol 28 60 Ne bIQ | 37.5D 5017

19 |Dormant Ol 25gal S0.(0 55,00 {4 50 Mo bid -
Prepared bywﬁw— page 2 of 2




Bid #: 26-008
Date: 01/22/2026

Project:

2026 Fertilizer & Pesticides

Time: 2:30 P.M. CST

Department:

Parks & Recreation

Van Dieast
Bidder Name 5 PP ‘\/
(¥
Bidder # Lﬂo)
20-0-20 Fertilizer w/ .
1 |50% WIN or more |50 Ib bag Na S \d
(no SCU or PCU)
18-24-12 Fertilizer w/
2 50% slow-release N 301k bag 5; LDL‘ b' BB
5-0-20 Fertilizer w/ ~
3 Dimension .19% S01h bag [')Q b‘d
Daconil
4 |Action/Chlorothalonil |12.5 gal jug q—s 8(0
53.94%
Halosulfuron 133 0z
5 |Pro/Sedgehammer/P - [ | DQ 8 o0
rosedge
Millennium )
6 |Ultra/Momentum/Batt 2.5 gal jug erSC';:Q,Q,S
leship
Aligare Mojave 70
7 EG 50 Ib case L;‘ ?}9-566
8 |Glyphosate 41% 2.5 gal 89 '?-I | Do
Lontrel / clopyralid 32 0z
2 |a0.9% bottle it s
Tempo SC Ultra /
. 240 ml
10 |Beta-Cyfluthrin bottle o‘/), ?—-} -CPO
11.8%
Banner Maxx Il / / t
11 Propiconazole 14.3% gl (‘" %
12 |aluminum sulfate |50 Ib bag Nne bia

/
initial
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UO«\ Nie s+
Bidder Name &*P p‘v

Bidder # ()
13 |Cutrine Plus liquid go%:ille &&, 1.0
| Cizer 2 | No bid
16 |Back anpxdve . |bowe S0.05

16 |Cutrine plus granular |30 Ib bag q l 8 CQ

15-0-4 fertilizer w/

17 |(-2) Al Imidacloprid |50 Ib bag & ¥ilsb 00
/

25% WIN PCU

18 |5-0-20 1% Ronstar |50 Ib bag f\Q bld.

19 |Dormant Qil 2.5 gal 5 fsm
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