

Bid # 25-083
 Date: 11/19/2025

Project: Water Treatment Plant Chemicals
 Time: 1:30PM CST Department: Water/Sewer

Bidder Name	Morton Salt	Univar Solutions	King Lee	Gunther Salt	Polydyne
Bidder #	(1)	(2)	(3)	(4)	(5)
Addendum #1	-	✓	✓	✓	✓
Addendum #2	-	-	✓	✓	✓
Item #1 - Sodium Hypochlorite 12.5% by wt, 15.5% by volume Bulk delivery (4,500 gallon)	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
Item #2 - Sodium Hydroxide 50%	↓	0.1835	↓	↓	↓
Item #3 - Sodium Hydroxide 25%	↓	0.1017	↓	↓	↓
Item #4 - Citric Acid (50 lb. bags)	↓	no bid	↓	↓	↓
Item #5 - Citric Acid (Totes)	↓	0.8404	↓	↓	↓
Item #6 - SF-4812 Polymer (55-gallon drums)	↓	no bid	↓	↓	1.30
Item #7A - Sodium Bisulfite (40%) (Totes)	↓	0.4461	↓	↓	no bid
Item # 7B - Sodium Bisulfite (40%) (Bulk)	↓	0.47	↓	↓	↓
Item #8 - Ammonium Hydroxide (19%) (Bulk)	↓	no bid	↓	↓	↓

Initials EG

Bidder #	(1)	(2)	(3)	(4)	(5)
Item #9 - Rock Salt	no bid	no bid	no bid	170.65	no bid
Item #10 - Chlorine Gas Cylinders (150 lb. cylinders)	↓	no bid	↓	no bid	↓
Item #11A - Sodium Hypochlorite (12.5 %) Deep Wells (Bulk)	↓	4.70	↓	↓	↓
Item #11B - Sodium Hypochlorite (12.5%) Deep Wells (Totes)	↓	no bid	↓	↓	↓
Item #12 - Liquid Ammonia Sulfate	↓	no bid	↓	↓	↓
Item #13 - Antiscalant (55-gallon drums)	↓	no bid	1.55	↓	1.50

Page 2 of 2

Prepared by: Christine Grabin, Purchasing Agent

Bid # 25-083
Date: 11/19/2025

Project: Water Treatment Plant Chemicals
Time: 1:30PM CST **Department:** Water/Sewer

Bidder Name	Hawkins	PVS DX	Solenis	Brenntag	
Bidder #	(6)	(7)	(8)	(9)	
Addendum #1	✓	-	✓	✓	
Addendum #2	✓	-	-	✓	
Item #1 - Sodium Hypochlorite 12.5% by wt, 15.5% by volume Bulk delivery (4,500 gallon)	1.68	1.609	no bid	1.7350	
Item #2 - Sodium Hydroxide 50%	no bid	no bid		0.1795	
Item #3 - Sodium Hydroxide 25%	no bid			0.0970	
Item #4 - Citric Acid (50 lb. bags)	2.00			2.09	
Item #5 - Citric Acid (Totes)	0.84			1.09	
Item #6 - SF-4812 Polymer (55-gallon drums)	no bid		✓	no bid	
Item #7A - Sodium Bisulfite (40%) (Totes)	0.39		0.57	no bid	
Item #7B - Sodium Bisulfite (40%) (Bulk)	0.39		0.55	0.290	
Item #8 - Ammonium Hydroxide (19%) (Bulk)	no bid	✓	no bid	0.2033	

Initials CG

Bidder #	(6)	(7)	(8)	(9)	
Item #9 - Rock Salt	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	
Item #10 - Chlorine Gas Cylinders (150 lb. cylinders)	1.30	1.323	↓	no bid	
Item #11A - Sodium Hypochlorite (12.5 %) Deep Wells (Bulk)	2.95	no bid	↓	2.21	
Item #11B - Sodium Hypochlorite (12.5%) Deep Wells (Totes)	2.95	↓	↓	2.21	
Item #12 - Liquid Ammonia Sulfate	0.35	↓	0.73	0.39	
Item #13 - Antiscalant (55-gallon drums)	no bid	↓	2.00	no bid	

Page 2 of 2

Prepared by: Christine Gnabin, Purchasing Agent