Bid #: _25-007

Project: 2025 Fertilizers & Pesticides

Department:

Parks & Recreation

Date: 01/29/2025 Time: 3:00 P.M. CST
RKane [Jon Dicat | (&, R. Site One Aduanced
er Name i oL E
Bidder N ﬁa%_}e{:do-i:ﬂfa— Supp ';} Qo. RObinSQA l.andicape %‘;{iu;kicnj
Bidder # £a) ¢ 23 (3) (<) (5)

1 |urea 46-0-0 50 Ib. bag DQXSO /‘7-’30 020 OO0 20,50 /q,95-
20-0-20 fertilizer w/ - . .
ey [ 9299 no bid | nobid | 2550 | No bid
3 |so% sowneleasen 00028 2132 D420 | 45,00 D800 DA.85
+ [omension 1% [bb2 | 39, D] no bid | A3.00 SR S0 DR, 15

Daconil Action /
5 g;lgzg/thalonil 25galivg| | |4} 5, D2 .85 g5, 00 25 00 55,00
Halosulfuron Pro /
o et 2= | 782 | o | sS0d | ooy | 60.00
Millennium Ultra / )
7 Momenum” - fesgaii| | D34 33 / OF.£0 Nobid [ | DFEL.L0
8 [pereMoive™o 105 | 1,002.00 | 437.50 | 550.00 Nno bid | &71.00
9 |[glyphosate 41% 2.5gal qq‘ LO &L‘)5 SOQB L;QIOQ 47(7‘50
10 [ s 2598 | 059.00 | 241.L3 | 200.60 /(500 | /2500
1| e [1obottel /(£ 00 /39-30 | Na bid /3%.30 4SO
12 [Cutrine Plus liquid ! 930 L8 23305 LLO,O0 A£3.50 Nno bid

initial ( é‘zz
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Bidder N Rahe Uan Diear G R. Site One /{]rduo:;)ud
er Name Hﬁ%:ﬁil Supply Co. |Robinson landsceape §s7 o dionA
Bidder # (1) (2) =) () (5)
13 |spray tank neutralizer|32 oz. qu 4 f F§a s d / q,m ’-7( o0 %).230
14 |foamer marker ;c?tfllz X‘é?/ :2( : /5 nQ bld &? QB @AL o0
15 [nonionic surfactant [2.5 gal jug ,,L'[ 7‘ /5 ;7» ?(P '7-5 QQ 5'() .00 69#06
16 |oiack onyndya . |botde o bid Nabid | N bid /2500 ne bid
17 |cutrine plus granular |30 Ib. bag /;2595 77-505 N b d C??‘ 00 95,06
18 | Dmension 1e% [010:0%9 | LR/ Jf Nno bid | LA350 2500 A0S
19 I;?r-rf’c;gs.icc))?\tygo% win [0 1b- bag 5? 99 Na bid No bid /féﬁ &1.05
75-04 Tertilizer w/ -
20 (2% A\INlmidaF::cI?Srid 50 Ib. bag 56 40 1540 /9 258 300 o Y
21 [Diuron 5Ib. bag LLE 33 A .80 Q{A OO 29.008 20, OS
22 :;?1::(;:7:'1/8.0% Zogaligl ¢y OFBHS No bid No bid §F9.01 §3.50
2 |t [ombss | 0 bId R9.80 No bid Lpth, SO 34 65

Prepared by: {
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Bid #: 25-007
Date: 01/29/2025

Project:

2025 Fertilizers & Pesticides

Time: 3:00 P.M. CST

Department:

Parks & Recreation

Bidder Name

Ne leaa
Ham‘

(&)

Bidder #

1 |urea 46-0-0 50 Ib. bag /(,0« 25
20-0-20 fertilizer w/

2 |50% WIN or more |50 Ib. bag A ? 59
(no SCU or PCU)

18-24-12 fertilizer w/

9 50% slow-release N 50 Ib. bag QQ q 9‘
5-0-20 fertilizer w/

4 Dimension .19% 50/lb. bag Qq . DB
Daconil Action /

5 [Chlorothalonil 2.5 gal jug DQ
53.94% q5:
Halosulfuron Pro / 1330z .

6 |Sedgehammer / bottle HES. 00
Prosedge
Millennium Ultra /

7 |Momentum / 2.5 gal jug Q
Battleship Iq 7—L5
Alligare Mojave 70 |50 Ib. e

% EG case O OO& CO

9 |glyphosate 41% 2.5gal L.}S ) Db
Finale / Glufosinate-

0 ammonium 11.33% 25,98l <95Y- 95
Gallery 75DF /

L Isoxaben 75% 11o:hetlle /5q 56

. Lo 1 gal
12 |Cutrine Plus liquid bottle 5'_:)". )9‘

initial _( g e

ae,l/of.{
PRy



Bidder Name

He&ng
ﬁ/?hl

(&)

Bidder #
13 |[spray tank neutralizer|32 oz. ,éD 5_0
1 gal R

14 |foamer marker bottle nc b)d,

15 |nonionic surfactant  |2.5 gal jug 35(0 JAY
Becker Underwood |1 gal

19 black onyx dye bottle / / 'L'/' 9‘9

17 |cutrine plus granular |30 Ib. bag X/vl 66
19-0-0 Fertilizer w/

8 Dimension .19% 50lb. bag 59'4 OQ
13-0-0 .09%

19 | Dimension 20% win [0 1P+ P39 /9.55
15-0-4 fertilizer w/

20 |(.2) Al Imidacloprid |50 Ib. bag Q O
25% WIN PCU S0

21 |Diuron 5lb. bag NO bld
Segment Il / .

o sethoxdim 18.0% Z.5gal jug 5-/9 ;56
13-0-0 Fertilizer

2 w/1% Ronstar =0ib. bag 3(9 8()

Prepared by: \_’//)/7/1%/424746!’1/ ; [A/ﬂ/?@l/\g/? /%Ugﬂfd'
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