

Bid #: 24-013

Project: 2024 Fertilizer & Pesticides

Department: Parks & Recreation

Date: 01/31/2024

Time: 2:00 P.M. CST

Bidder Name		Advanced Turb Solutions	Van Diest Supply Company			
Bidder #		(1)	(2)			
1	Urea 46-0-0	\$21.25	\$18.85			
2	20-0-20 fertilizer w/ 50% WIN or more (no SCU or PCU)	\$23.50	\$36.45			
4	18-24-12 fertilizer w/ 50% WIN SCU or PCU	\$23.35	\$28.35			
7	Banner Max II / Propiconazole 14.3%	\$99.00	\$69.35			
9	Primo Maxx / Podium / Trinexapac-ethyl 11.3%	\$146.50	\$317.00			
11	Halosulfuron Pro / Sedgehammer / Prosege	\$53.40	\$52.50			
12	Millennium Ultra / Momentum / Battleship	\$233.00	\$233.00			
13	Alligare Mojave 70 EG	\$53.00	\$10.20			
14	Glyphosate 41%	\$50.00	\$43.58			
15	Finale / Glufosinate-ammonium 11.33%	\$265.23	\$271.88			
20	Prodiamine 65WDG	\$95.00	\$91.50			
25	Forbid 4F	\$268.15	\$290.70			
32	Spray tank neutralizer	\$15.50	\$24.55			

initial

Bidder Name		Advanced Turf Solutions	Van Diest Supply Company			
Bidder #		(1)	(2)			
37	Nonionic surfactant	\$ 60.00	\$ 58.58			
43	19-0-0 Fertilizer w/ Dimension .19%	\$ 22.75	\$ 24.30			
45	5-0-20 1% Ronstar	\$ 42.50	no bid			
46	13-0-0 .09% Dimension 20% WIN	\$ 21.50	\$ 21.15			
48	Diuron	\$ 30.00	\$ 26.25			
51	Lontrel / Clopyralid 40.9%	\$ 199.55	\$ 190.85			
52	Peters Excel 15-2- 20, Pansy / Salvia / Vinca	no bid	no bid			
53	Jacks 20-3-19 Petunia FeED Plus Mg	no bid	no bid			
54	0-0-7 Dimension 0.21%	\$ 18.00	\$ 37.60			
55	21-0-3 w/ (.2) AI Inidacloprid 30% WIN	\$ 22.70	\$ 25.60			

Prepared by: Christine Gnablin, Purchasing Agent